
CITY OF OWOSSO BID TABULATION SHEET DATE 5/30/2023
DEPT. DPW

SUBJECT:

EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM # DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1 State Certified Class II 3,000 Ton 7.75$           23,250.00$       8.85$            26,550.00$          11.75$            35,250.00$        
Backfill Sand

2 State Certified 22A 1,200 Ton 12.95$         15,540.00$       13.60$          16,320.00$          16.00$            19,200.00$        
Gravel

3 Limestone 21AA 500 Ton 26.90$         13,450.00$       26.60$          13,300.00$          28.32$            14,160.00$        

4 Limestone 6A 150 Ton 28.90$         4,335.00$         30.75$          4,612.50$            30.82$            4,623.00$          

5 Limestone H1 200 Ton 36.65$         7,330.00$         NO BID -$  40.03$            8,006.00$          

*CORRECTED
MATHEMATICAL ERROR

63,905.00$       60,782.50$          81,239.00$        

DEPT
HEAD AWARDED:

PURCH. WORKERS COMPENSATION INSURANCE COUNCIL

AGENT: EXPIRATION DATE: APPROVED:

STAFF SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP 

REC.: *See Box Above EXPIRATION DATE: N/A PO NUMBER:

Ocenasek, Inc. Jackson Trucking LLC
5817 W. Britton Rd. 1724 Corunna Ave
Perry, MI  48872 Owosso, MI 48867
517-625-3242 989-494-9979

GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE

All Bidders are located in Shiawassee County - No Pricing Adjustments for Local Preference

Great Lakes Fusion
7505 E M71
Durand, MI  48429
989-288-2656

*See Box Above

2023-2024 Sand, Gravel and
Limestone Bid

A. Smith Sand & Gravel:           
State Certified Class II Backfill Sand: $6.00 per ton.    
B. Oenasek, Inc.:                                                           
State Certified 22A Gravel: $12.95 per ton. 
Limestone 6A : $28.90 per ton.
Limestone H1: $36.65 per ton.  
C. Jackson Trucking   Limestone 21AA: $26.90 per ton. 



DATE 5/24/2022
DEPT. DPW

SUBJECT: Page 2

EST. UNIT UNIT
ITEM # DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1 State Certified Class II 3,000 Ton 6.00             18,000.00$       -$                     -$                   
Backfill Sand

2 State Certified 22A 1,200 Ton NO BID -$                  -$                     -$                   
Gravel

3 Limestone 21AA 500 Ton NO BID -$                  -$                     -$                   

4 Limestone 6A 150 Ton NO BID -$                  -$                     -$                   

5 Limestone H1 200 Ton NO BID -$                  -$                     -$                   

18,000.00$       -$                     -$                   
TOTAL BID PRICING ADJUSTED FOR LOCAL PURCHASING PREFERENCE: -$                

2022-2023 Sand, Gravel and
Limestone Bid

517-625-3228

Smith Sand & Gravel
4085 W. Tyrell Road
Owosso, MI  48867
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